
Cookies Usage Policy  

 
What are cookies? 

This website uses cookies to improve your experience while visiting the website. 
Cookies are small files which can be saved on the user's computer or mobile device that 
monitors, saves and stores information about user interactions and use of the website. 
This allows website through its server to provide users with personalized approach to 

this website. 

 

This site uses visitor tracking software, to better understand how they use it. This is the 
software provided by Yandex.Metrica, which uses cookies for tracking summary 
statistics that allow us to understand how people use our site. The software will save a 
cookie to your computer or mobile device to track and control your participation and use 
of the website, but will not store, retain or collect personal information. 

 

Cookies are small text files that can be stored on your computer or other device when 
you visit the website. They are typically used to power websites, track your navigation of 
the website, remember your registration details, etc. There are different types of 
cookies, and they can be distinguished by origin, purpose and service life. Important file 
characteristics cookies include the following: 

 

• On the one hand, cookies are files that are placed on a website you are visiting, while 
cookies are being placed on the wrong site (third party) you are visiting. Please note 

that we do not control the collection or further use of data by third parties. 

• Necessary cookies – necessary for the technical operation of the website. (for 
example, they allow you to navigate and use the website functions). 

• Performance cookies – collect performance data and website performance such as 
number of visitors, time, time spent on the site, and error messages. 

• Functional cookies – improve the usability of the website, remembering your choices 

(for example, language, region, login, etc.). 

• Targeting/Advertising Cookies – allow a website to send you personalized advertising. 

• Session cookies are temporary cookies that are erased after closing your browser 
while persistent cookies remain on your device until you remove them manually or until 
your browser will not delete them based on the time period specified in the file 

persistent cookies. 

More information about all aspects of cookies can be found at website 
www.allaboutcookies.org 

http://www.allaboutcookies.org/


 

What types of cookies do we use? 

1. Required cookies 

These types of cookies are necessary to enable you to navigate our website and use its 

features (such as secure areas of the site, for example, feedback form “Ask a question”) 

2. Performance cookies 

These cookies collect anonymous information about the pages visited. By using our 
site, you agree that we can host these files cookies on your device. These cookies 
collect information about how visitors use the website, such as which page was visited 
and whether any error messages. All information obtained from these cookies is 

anonymous. 

3. Functional Cookies 

To improve your experience on our website, these cookies are used to remember the 
choices you make. These cookies can be used to remember your name, the region you 
are in, changes to text size, font and other parts of the website that can be tuned. 

4. Targeting/Advertising Cookies 

These cookies collect information about your browsing habits to make advertising more 
relevant to you and your interests. They can also be used to limit the number of times 
an advertisement is viewed. They are usually placed on advertising networks with our 
permission, they remember that you have visited the website. This information is shared 

with other organizations (to third parties) such as advertisers. 

5. Other sites 

This website may contain links to other websites or platforms, which are beyond our 
control and are not subject to this policy. You should read the privacy policy of the 

website or platform. 

 

Please note that the processing of your personal data in connection with cookies files 

and other purposes are subject to our privacy policy. 

 

How can you manage cookies? 

Most internet browsers are set to automatically accept cookies. Depending on your 
browser, you may be able to customize your browser so that it warns you before 
accepting cookies, or you can set it up to refuse them. Please refer to the button "Help" 

(or similar) in your browser to learn more about how you can do it. 

Disabling cookies may affect your experience on our website. 



If you use different devices to access our websites, you need to make sure that for 
every browser on every device your cookie preferences are set. 

For more information on how to manage cookies, you can receive at: 

http://www.allaboutcookies.org/manage-cookies/ 

Alternatively, you may refuse cookies by visiting the following sites and by selecting the 
company cookies you want to refuse of: 
 
http://www.aboutads.info/choices/#completed  

 

and   
 
http://www.youronlinechoices.com/ 
 

http://www.allaboutcookies.org/manage-cookies/
http://www.aboutads.info/choices/#completed

